
	

 

 

 

CELEBRATE LOVE AND LUXURY AT ROSEATE HOTELS & RESORTS 

 

New Delhi ,  February 2022: Still thinking of ideas to make Valentine’s day memorable for 
your loved one? Celebrate love and luxury at Roseate Hotels and Resorts. Enjoy specially 
crafted culinary delights, offers and Valentine’s special amenities amidst special décor across our 
hotels and resorts, ISKATE by Roseate and Roasted by Roseate. 

 

THE ROSEATE NEW DELHI  
 
The Roseate New Delhi is a one of its kind urban resort with eight acres of verdant green and 
water bodies. The luxury resort is the perfect place for celebrating this special occasion with 
your Valentine. 
 
Enjoy an exemplary, fine-dining experience this Valentine’s Day at Kiyan, world cuisine all day 
dining restaurant at The Roseate. On offer is the Chef's special delicious four course menu 
paired with wine, special decor and a Valentine special dessert at INR 9,999 ++  per couple. 
 
This package is also available at a special seating arrangement amidst Isfahan columns 
surrounded by water bodies at 14,999++ per couple and nestled in luxury with an intimate 
private dining set up at INR 29,999++ per couple. 
 
Celebrate Valentine’s Day with your loved one at Chi Ni ,  the only restaurant under a tent 
canopy in the country. Amidst enchanting decor, a four course meal paired with wine and a 
delicious dessert will be offered at INR 9999++ per couple. 
 
ROSEATE HOUSE NEW DELHI 

Express your love in the lap of luxury at the most instagrammable Presidential suite of the 
town. While experiencing luxury at the coveted suite of Roseate House New Delhi, enjoy 
dinner with sparkling wine served by a private butler, a rejuvenating spa treatment, special 
bubble bath, bouquet and cake, breakfast in bed, pick and drop in a BMW car (optional).  
All at INR 1,50,000 ++ per couple per night.  



	

 
 

 

This Valentine’s Day you could also treat your loved one to a romantic dinner under the 
twinkling stars of the night sky at Tara, an open rooftop lounge overlooking the infinity pool at 
the Roseate House. A Valentine special set menu has been curated by the executive chef 
accompanied by a bottle of sparkling wine, bouquet, choice of cake or chocolates and a 
souvenir. Priced at INR 20,000++ per couple. Arrive and leave in style in a BMW car, at an 
additional charge. 

Enjoy a delicious feast at our all-day dining restaurant DEL, loved equally by our residents and 
non-resident guests. It includes a special Valentine's Day dinner buffet along with choice of 
cocktail/mocktail  on arrival and a special cake at INR 6500++ per couple (INR 3499+ taxes 
per person). Enjoy the luxury of a bespoke table arrangement and a dedicated butler at DEL at 
INR 10,000++ per couple. 
 
KHEER: Immerse yourself in the unforgettable flavours of India along with your loved one over 
dinner. Valentine’s Day offer includes an unlimited set menu,  a customised cake  and a 
souvenir. Priced at INR 7500+ + per couple and INR 4000++ per person. 

Let love brew @Roseate : Soak in the spirit of love and warmth at Roasted by Roseate, our in 
house patisserie and boulangerie. 

Enjoy your favourite refreshing beverages at a special Valentine’s Day discount of 25%. 

 
THE ROSEATE GANGES, RISHIKESH 
 
Celebrate and unwind at the unparalleled, luxury retreat on the banks of the river Ganges in 
the tranquil valleys of Rishikesh. 

Enjoy a special Valentine’s Day lunch by the infinity pool overlooking the surrounding valley. 
Package includes a welcome drink, two glasses of red or white sangria, four course set menu 
and a special red velvet cake at INR 8999 AI per couple.  

This package (exclusive of wine) can also be availed at the Chidya Ghar restaurant, overlooking 
the serene hills and verdant greens at INR 4500 AI per couple. 

 

 



	

 

 

 
ROASTED BY ROSEATE, VASANT KUNJ 

Create sweet memories with delicious customised cakes from Roasted by Roseate. On the 
occasion, treat your loved one with a special heart shaped pizza and a pastry with our best 
compliments.  

Say it  with CHOCOLATE BITES BY ROSEATE 

A fine selection of gourmet chocolate bars, rocks and bombs - ‘Chocolate Bites by Roseate’ 
are packed in very elegantly designed boxes and are a delightful expression of love. 
Handcrafted with the finest ingredients, these chocolates make for a perfect Valentine’s gifting 
option to show you care.  

 

ISKATE BY ROSEATE 

Go beyond the clichéd and propose to your beloved at the nation’s largest and only all-
weather indoor ice skating arena. ISKATE by Roseate creates a truly magical setup for you to 
celebrate your love.  The package includes three course set menu, a private dining area, 
exclusive availability of the arena as well as an ice-skating session for two, a  photo souvenir 
along with a Valentine’s Day special gift, all at  INR 4999 (all inclusive). Don’t fall, glide in love.  

ABOUT ROSEATE HOTELS & RESORTS 

Roseate Hotels and Resorts is a collection of uber luxury hotels consisting of six niche hotels 
across India and the U.K with more under development. The name ‘Roseate’ comes from a 
bird with pink hued plumage. Avant-garde, imaginative and contemporary in design each 
Roseate hotel has a story to tell. Key focus is laid on the service, aesthetics and detailing of 
hotels that pave way to stylized accommodation with high business efficiencies at city hotels 
and exquisite leisure option at resort location. 
 
Hashtags :   
#loveandluxury #experiencetheunimagined #glideinlove #roseatehotelsandresorts 
#neverleave #roastedbyroseate 
 


